ORDINANCE NO. 09-0-2

FIRE PREVENTION AND INSPECTION ORDINANCE OF THE
DARTEN-WOODRIDGE FIRE PROTECTION DISTRICT
DU PAGE COUNTY, ILLINOIS

PASSED AND APPROVED BY THE
CORPORATE AUTHORITIES OF THE
DARIEN-WOODRIDGE FIRE PROTECTION DISTRICT,
DU PAGE COUNTY, ILLINOIS
THIS 19+ DAY OF AUGUST, 2009

Published in pamphlet form

by authority of the President

and Board of Trustees of the
Darien-Woodtidge Fire Protection
District this 19% Day of August, 2009




II.

IIL

VL

VIL

TABLE QF CONTENTS

Fire Prevention Code - Life Safety Code - Building Code............... 4
Adopted - Modifications and Amendments

Emergency Procedures. ... sessenes 16
Plan Reviews and FEes.. ..o sseressssssnes 17
False Alarm Service Chatge ....cccvercererneonmronminnsinrirsssssssasrsssenenins 19
Cause and Ongin Inspection and.......cccceeonnennneinsiniensrerenanns 20
Investigation Fees

Hazardous Materials Incident........oocceeoncormiimmrnncnssssisssosseneenennne 21

Remediation Charges

(GENETAl PLOVISIONS cvcvviceiceireeeteeieeiesseeeessessesessesnssssssessesssmssesessessesaes 24




ORDINANCE NO. 09-0-2

FIRE PREVENTION ORDINANCE OF THE DARIEN-WOODRIDGE
FIRE PROTECTION DISTRICT, DU PAGE COUNTY, ILLINOIS

WHEREAS, the Darien-Woodridge Fire Protection District, an Illinois municipal corpotation,
of DuPage County, Illinois, was created pursuant to the provisions of the Fire Protéction District Act;
and

WHEREAS, 70 ILCS 705/6 provides that the board of trustees has full power to pass all
necessary ordinances, rules and regulations for the proper management and conduct of the business of
the board of trustees of the fire protection district for carrying into effect the objects for which the
district was formed; and

WHEREAS, 70 ILCS 705/11 provides that the board of trustees has the power and it is its legal
duty and obligation to provide as neaﬁy adequate protection from fire for all petsons and property
within the district as possible, and to prescribe necessary regulations for the prevention and conttol of
fire therein, and grants to the board of trustees the express power to adopt and enforce fire prevention
codes and standards parallel to national standards.

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT ORDAINED by the Board of Trustees of the Darien-Woodridge

Fire Protection District, DuPage County, Illinois, as follows:




I

FIRE PREVENTION CODE - LIFE SAFETY CODE - BUILDING CODE

Adopted - Modifications and Amendments

There s hereby adopted by reference, as if fully set out at length herein, and except as modified or
amended as provided herein, for the purpose of presctibing regulations governing conditions hazardous
to life and property from fire or explosion certain Codes which are known as:

A

THE INTERNATIONAL FIRE CODE/2006 Edition tecommended by the International
Code Council, 900 Montclair Road, Birmingham, AL, 35213. The purpose of this Code s to
presctibe requirements and controls to safeguard life, property, or public welfare from the
hazards of fire and explosion.

NFPA #101, LIFE SAFETY CODE - 2006 Edition, promulgated by the National Fire
Protection Association, 1 Batterymatch Park, Quincy, MA 02269-9904. The purpose of this
Code is to prescribe requirements and controls to safeguard life from fire and similar
emergencies.

THE INTERNATIONAL BUILDING CODE/2006 Edition recommended by International
Code Council, 900 Montclair Road, Birmingham, AL, 35213. The purpose of this Code 1s to
prescribe requirements and controls to insure the public safety, health and welfare insofar as
they are affected by building construction and to secure safety to life and property from all
hazards incident to the occupancy of buildings, structures, or premises.

In the event property is located within a municipality or county which has adopted higher or
more stringent standards and requirements than those set forth in the codes and ordinances of
the Darien-Woodridge Fite Protection District, or an Intergovernmental Agreement is at any
time in place, then those standards and requirements shall apply, and the provisions thereof are
incorporated herein by reference, as if fully set out at length herein.

The terms and provisions of any Intergovernmental Agreement with a municipality or the
County of DuPage pertaining to the subject matter of this Ordinance are incorporated herein by
reference and are made a part hereof. If thete is a conflict between the terms and provisions of
this Ordinance and any such Intergovernmental Agreement, the terms and provisions of the
Intergovernmental Agreement shall control.

AMENDMENTS TO CODE: The following additions, insertions, deletions and changes are hereby
made to the INTERNATIONAL FIRE CODE/2006 EDITION:

Section 102.4 Application of building code. Delete in its entirety and in lieu thereof substitute
the following new Section 102.4:

Section 102.4 Application of building code. The design and construction of new




structures, as well as the repair, alteration and addition to existing structures shall
comply with the INTERNATIONAL BUILDING CODE/2006, SECOND PRINTING,
as prepared and published by the International Code Council, Inc., and as amended by
the Datien-Woodridge Fire Protection District. All references herein to the
“International Existing Building Code” shall be deleted, and in lieu thereof substitute
the INTERNATIONAL BUILDING CODE/2006, SECOND PRINTING, as prepared
and published by the International Code Council, Inc., and as amended by the Darien-
Woodridge Fire Protection District.

Section 102.4 Application of building code. Amend by adding the following new Sections
102.4.1 and 102.4.2:

Section 102.4.1 Application of electrical code. All references within this code to the “ICC
Electrical Code™” shall be changed to read, “NATIONAL ELECTRICAL CODE, 2005
EDITION (NFPA 70-2005)”, as prepared and published by the National Fire Protection
Association, Inc. The provisions of said Electrical Code shall apply to the installation,
alteration, repair, and replacement of electrical systems, including equipment, appliances,
fixtures, fittings and appurtenances thereto.

Section 102.4.2 Application of plumbing code. All references within this code to the
“International Plumbing Code” shall be changed to read, “ILLINOIS PLUMBING CODE
20047, as sponsored and published by the Illinois Department of Public Health. The
provisions of said Plumbing Code shall apply to the installation, alteration, repair and
replacement of plumbing systems, including appliances, fixtures, fittings and appurtenances
thereto.

Section 104.7.1 Materials and equipment reuse. Delete in its entirety.
Section 110 UNSAFE BUILDINGS. Amend by adding the following new Section 110.5:

Section 110.5 Fire watch. When deemed necessary by the Fire Code Official, a fire watch
shall be ordered in accordance with this code. The Fire Code Official shall determine the
number of personnel required and the duration necessary for the fire watch. Conditions that
may require a fire watch include, but are not limited to, the following:

1. Where fire safety equipment or fire protection systems for a building are placed
out of service, and will not likely be restored immediately;

2. Where the fire load in a building is greater than the normal daily operations; or

3. Where other unsafe or hazardous conditions exist.

Section 304.2 Storage. Delete in its entirety and in lieu thereof substitute the following new
Section 304.2;




Section 304.2 Storage. Storage of combustible rubbish shall not produce conditions
that will create a nuisance or a hazard to the public health, safety or welfare.
Combustible materials shall be removed daily or more often as is necessary to
suitable vaults, bins, dumpsters, or compactors. Such practices shall be as approved
by the Fire Code Official.

Section311.2.1 Security. Delete in its entirety and in lieu thereof substitute the following new
Section 311.2.1:

Section 311.2.1 Security. Every person owning or having charge or control of any
vacant or fire damaged building shall remove all combustible waste and refuse therein.
Exterior openings and intertor openings accessible to other tenants or unauthorized
persons shall be boarded, locked, blocked, or otherwise protected to prevent entry by
unauthorized individuals.

Section 311.2.2 Fire protection. Delete Exceptions in their entirety.

Section 315.3 Outside storage. Delete Exceptions in their entirety.

Section 401.1 Scope. Delete Exception in its entirety.

Section 404.2 Where required. Amend by adding the following new Subsection 14:
14.  Non-transient hotels and motels.

Section404 FIRE SAFETY AND EVACUATION PLANS. Amend by adding the following
new Section 404.6:

404.6 Posting. Fire Evacuation Procedure Notice. Owners, managers, and agents of
multiple dwelling buildings with four (4) or more stories, motels, hotels and places of
assembly shall post and maintain in a conspicuous location within each dwelling unit
and in access routes, a written notice which explains what procedures to use in the
event of a fire. The notice shall contain a diagram of all fire exits.

Section 503 FIRE APPARATUS ACCESS ROADS. Amend by adding the following new
Section 503.7:

Section 503.7 Additional design components. Design components shall be provided
so that:

1. Public or private access is provided to each building so that the first responding fire
department pumper unit will be able to be so located that all points of the interior of the
building may be reached by one hundred fifty feet (150") of initial attack hose.




Where the size or height of the building does not allow this regulation to be met, an
interior standpipe system equipped with fire department hose connections approved by
the Fire Code Official may be allowed as an exception. The standpipe system shall be
connected to a public water system.

A minimum of two (2) two and one-half inch (2 1/2") inlets (fire department
connections) shall be provided.

2. The public or private access for motor fire apparatus shall be provided such that
there may be proper operation of ladders and mechanically elevated mechanisms, and
as shown on the approved site plan.

3. Access routes shall be so arranged that fire department apparatus may respond from
all points of the building to adjacent fire hydrants along routes not to exceed three
hundred feet (300"} from the most remote point of the building perimeter to the closest
fire hydrant.

4. Fire lanes on private property shall be approved by the Fire Code Official, and
parking of motor vehicles otherwise obstructing such fire lanes or access routes shall be
prohibited at all times. Permanent all-weather signs identifying fire lanes and
accessways shall be posted.

5. Access roads or fire lanes for unlimited area buildings and buildings over thirty feet
(30") in height may be not less than fifteen feet (15") from the buildings, unless the
adjacent wall has a fire-resistive rating of two (2) hours, minimum. This optional
design must be approved by the Fire Code Official. If the height of the building
requires a greater set back to ladder the buildings, the distance from the building shall
be as approved by the Fire Code Official.

Section 506.1 Where required. Delete in its entirety and in lieu thereof substitute the following
new Section 506.1:

Section 506.1 Where required. Where access to or within a structure or an area is
restricted because of secured openings, or where immediate access is necessary for life-
saving or fire-fighting purposes, the Fire Code Official shall require a key box to be
installed in an approved location. In addition, the Fire Code Official shall require all
existing structures that are required to be equipped with an approved fire alarm system
that consists of smoke and/or heat detection, and all buildings required to be equipped
with a complete sprinkler system, to have an approved key box system.

Section 506 KEY BOXES. Amend by adding the following new Sections 506.3, 506.4, and
506.5:




Section 506.3 Height. The key box shall not be located higher than five feet (5’) above
grade. If there are practical difficulties locating the key box at this height, the location
shall be approved by the Fire Code Official.

Section 506.4 Contents. The approved key box shall be sized to contain all keys, key
cards and access code information necessary to gain access to and throughout the
building as required by the Fire Code Official.

Section 506.5 Alarms. At the request of the owner or lessee, the Fire Code Official
shall permit to be installed a key box tamper switch connected to the building's alarm
system. If the owner or lessee chooses to connect the key box to an alarm then he shall
comply with the following requirement:

If the building is protected by a burglar alarm system, the key box shall be
connected to that system.

Section 508.5.1 Where required. Delete in its entirety and in lieu thereof substitute the
following new Section 508.5.1:

Section 508.5.1 Where required. Where a portion of the facility or building hereafter
constructed or moved into or within the jurisdiction is more than three hundred (300°)
feet from a hydrant on a fire apparatus road, as measured by an approved route around
the exterior of the facility or building, on-site fire hydrants and mains shall be provided
where required by the Fire Code Official.

Section 508.5 Fire hydrant systems. Amend by adding the following new Section 508.5.7:

Section 508.5.7 Installation. The installation of fire hydrants shall be in accordance
with the following:

1. Water supplies shall be delivered to fire hydrants under pressure equitable to
the adjacent municipal main.

2. Fire hydrants shall be located along public streets, fire lanes, or access routes so
that no portion of the building perimeter will be over three hundred feet (300")
from a public fire hydrant. Where this is not possible, hydrants shall be placed
along the access route at a location approved by the Fire Code Official.

3. Access to fire hydrants shall be made by all-weather roadways adequate in
width, clearance and strength for fire fighting purposes. Such routes, including
private roadways, shall be maintained accessible during all seasons of the year.

4. Hydrants shall be located approximately ten feet (10°) from all-weather
roadways. Where approved by the Fire Code Official, a hydrant may be placed
no less than three feet (3°) from an all-weather roadway.




9.

10.

11.

In apartments, town houses, condominiums, town/row or cluster housing areas
where streets or parking lots dead end, hydrants shall be placed along the access
route at a location approved by the Fire Code Official.

Atleast iwo (2) fire hydrants shall be located within three hundred feet (300") of
the building.

Hydrants shall not be located closer than twenty-five feet (25°) to a building.
Each hydrant shall have the pumper (steamer) connection facing the primary
all-weather roadway, and shall be accessible from said roadway.

Fire hydrant outlets/connections shall be located no less than eighteen inches
(18”) and no more than thirty-six inches (36”) above the finished grade.

Fire hydrants shall be protected from accidental damage by approved methods
when located in areas subject to vehicular damage.

A fire hydrant shall be located within seventy-five feet (75”) of the building fire
department connection.

Section 510 FIRE DEPARTMENT ACCESS TO EQUIPMENT. Amend by adding the
following new Section 510.2:

Section 510.2 Access to fire equipment. In multiple single-family dwellings where no
interior common area exists, fire alarm panels and sprinkler system valves shall be
located in a room accessible only to qualified, including Darien-Woodridge Fire
Protection District, personnel. The Darien-Woodridge Fire Protection District shall
have access to such room and equipment at any time unless approved otherwise by the
Fire Code Official.

Section 607.1 Required. Amend by adding the following new Section 607.1.1:

Section 607.1.1 Size. At least one (1) elevator shall be provided for Darien-Woodridge
Fire Protection District emergency access to accommodate a stretcher to all floors of
the building. The minimum clearance distance between walls or between a wall and a
door, excluding return panels, shall not be less than the following:

1. Center door — minimum of forty-two (42”) inches of clear opening at the door and
interior clear dimensions of not less than sixty-three (63”) inches deep and eighty
(80”) inches wide,

2. Side door — minimum of forty-two (42} inches of clear opening at the door and
interior clear dimensions of not less than fifty-one (51”) inches deep and eighty
(80) inches wide.

Section 607 ELEVATOR RECALL AND MAINTENANCE. Amend by adding the following
new Section 607.4:

Section 607.4 Elevator phone. An elevator phone, where required, shall terminate




directly at a location specified or approved by the Fire Code Official.

Section 806.1.1 Restricted occupancies. Delete in its entirety and in licu thereof substitute the
following new Section 804.1.1:

Section 804.1.1 Restricted occupancies. Natural cut trees shall only be allowed in
Group R-2 and R-3.

Section 903.2 Where required. Delete in its entirety and in lieu thereof substitute the following
new Section 903.2:

Section 903.2 Where required. Approved automatic sprinkler systems shall be
provided throughout all new buildings and structures other than buildings of Use Group
R-3 and Use Group U.

Section 903.2.1 Group A. Delete in its entirety.

Section 903.2.2 Group E. Delete in its entirety.

Section 903.2.3 Group F-1. Delete in its entirety.

Section 903.2.4 Group H. Delete in its entirety.

Section 903.2.5 Group I. Delete in its entirety.

Section 903.2.6 Group M. Delete in its entirety.

Section 903.2.7 Group R. Delete in its entirety.

Section 903.2.8 Group S-1. Delete in its entirety.

Section 903.2.9 Group S-2. Delete in its entirety.

Section 903.4 Sprinkler system monitoring and alarms. Delete Exceptions in their entirety and
in lieu thereof substitute the following Exception.

Exception: Limited area systems serving fewer than 20 sprinklers.

Section 905.1 General. Delete in its entirety and in lieu thereof substitute the following new
Section 905.1:

Section 905.1 General. Class I standpipe systems shall be provided in new buildings
and structures in accordance with this section. All references herein to either Class II

10




standpipe system(s) or Class II standpipe system(s) shall be deleted and in lieu thereof
shall substitute the words “Class 1 standpipe system(s)”. Fire hose threads used in
connection with standpipe systems shall be approved and shall be compatible with
Darien-Woodridge Fire Protection District hose threads. The location of the hose
connections shall be approved. In buildings used for high-pile combustible storage, fire
protection shall be in accordance with CHAPTER 23.

Section 905.3.1 Building height. Delete Exceptions in their entirety.
Section 905.3.1 Building height. Amend by adding the following new Section:
Section 905.3.1.1 Building area. Class I standpipe systems shall be installed in all
buildings where any portion of the building’s interior area is more than one hundred
fifty (150°) feet of travel vertically and horizontally from the nearest point of fire
fighting vehicle access.
Section 905.7.2 Locking cabinet doors. Delete Exception Nos. 1 and 2 in their entirety.
Section 905.8 Dry standpipes. Delete in its entirety.
Section 906.1 Where Required. Amend by adding the following new subsection 7:
7. Within five feet (5°) of all exit doors in all but R-3 occupancies. If there are
practical difficulties in locating the fire extinguisher within five feet (5°) then it
shall be as directed by the Fire Code Official.

Section 907.1.2 Equipment. Delete in its entirety and in lieu thereof substitute the following
new Section 907.1.2:

Section 907.1.2 Equipment. Systems and their components shall be listed and
approved for the purpose for which they are installed. All fire alarm systems shall be

relegated to fire alarm associated equipment and not be combined with burglar alarm
equipment.

Section 907.1 General. Amend by adding the following new Section 907.1.3:

Section 907.1.3 Supervision. Required automatic detection and alarm systems shall be
directly connected to the Darien-Woodridge Fire Protection District dispatch center.

Section 907.1 General. Amend by adding the following new Section 907.1.4:

Section 907.1.4 Acceptance testing. Testing of alarm systems shall be done in
accordance with NFPA 72, and a Certificate of Completion shall be provided to the

11




Fire Code Official.

Section 907.1 General. Amend by adding the following new Section 907.1.5:

Section 907.1.5 Power Source. All backup emergency power supplies for fire alarm
systems or devices shall be capable of providing full operation of the system or device
for a minimum of 60 hours upon loss of primary power,

Section 907.2 Where required —new buildings and structures. Add the following paragraph:
All wiring in non-accessible areas shall be installed in electrical metallic tubing but
may be run exposed in accessible areas over eight (8°-0”) feet above finished floor
such as, but not limited to, spaces above dropped ceilings, attic spaces, crawl spaces
and must be properly fastened.

Section 907.2.1 Group A. Delete Exception in its entirety.

Section 907.2.2 Group B. Delete Exception in its entirety.

Section 907.2.3 Group E. Delete Exceptions in their entirety.

Section 907.2.4 Group F. Delete Exception in its entirety.

Section 907.2.7 Group M. Delete Exception 2 in its entirety.

Section 907.2.8 Group R-1. Amend by adding the following new Section 907.2.8.4:
Section 907.2.8.4 Means of egress. Automatic smoke detectors, connected directly to
the fire alarm system, shall be installed at the top of each exit stairway and spaced no
more than every third floor below exit accessways and common area means of egress
corridors.

Section 907.2.8.1 Manual fire alarm system. Delete Exceptions in their entirety.

Section 907.2.9 Group R-2. Delete Exceptions Nos. 1 and 2 in their entirety.

Section 907.2.9 Group R-2. Amend by adding the following new Section 907.2.9.1:
Section 907.2.9.1 Means of egress. Automatic smoke detectors, connected directly to
the fire alarm system, shall be installed at the top of each exit stairway and spaced no

more than every third floor below, exit accessways and common area means of egress
corridors.

12




Section 907.9 Zones. Delete in its entirety and in lieu thereof substitute the following new
Section 907.9:

Section 907.9 Zones. For non addressable fire alarm systems, each floor and tenant
space shall be zoned separately, and a zone shall not exceed twenty thousand (20,000)
sq. ft. in area. The length of any zone shall not exceed two hundred (200”) feet in any
direction, unless otherwise approved by the Fire Code Official.

Section 907.9.2 High-rise buildings. Delete in its entirety and in lieu thereof substitute the
following new Section 907.9.2:

Section 907.9.2 All buildings. A separate zone by floor shall be provided for all of the
following types of alarm initiating devices where provided:

Detection devices;

Sprinkler water-flow devices;

Manual fire alarm boxes;

Devices in each tenant space of a multi-tenant occupancy; and

Other approved types of automatic fire detection devices or suppression
systems,

Nk WD

Section 907.15 Monitoring.. Delete in its entirety and in lieu thereof substitute the following
new Section 907.15:

Section 907.15 Monitoring. Where required by this chapter or by the International
Building Code, the fire alarm system shall be monitored by the Darien-Woodridge Fire
Protection District. All new fire alarm systems shall transmit their signals by radio
directly to the Darien-Woodridge Fire Protection District.

Add a new Section 907.15.1 Existing Level of Service
Any existing building currently having a fire alarm system connected via a radio
transmitted to the Darien-Woodridge Fire Protection District must continue that level of
service, unless approved by the Fire Code Official.

Add a new Section 907.20.1.1 Radio Maintenance
Any maintenance required to the radio used to transmit fire alarm signals, or to the
radio network of Darien-Woodridge Fire Protection District, shall be performed by the
vendor contracted by the Datien-Woodridge Fire Protection District.

Section 912.2 Location. Delete in its entirety and in lieu thereof substitute the following new
Section 912.2:

Section 912.2 Location. With respect to hydrants, driveways, buildings, and

13




landscaping, fire department connections shall be clear of obstructions, and shall be
located such that the fire apparatus and hose connected to supply the system will not
obstruct access to the building for other fire apparatus. The location of the fire
department connections shall be approved.

Section 913.4 Valve supervision. Delete Exceptions 3 and 4 in its entirety.

Section 1027.3 Exit sign illumination. Delete in its entirety and in lieu thereof substitute the
following new Section 1026.3:.

Section 1027.3 Exit sign illumination. All newly installed exit signs shall be internally
illuminated and supplied with emergency back-up power.

Section 1027.5 Illumination emergency power, Delete in its entirety and in lieu thercof
substitute the following new Section 1026.5:

Section 1027.5 Ilumination emergency power. The power supply for means of egress
illumination shall normally be provided for by the premises’ electrical supply. In the
event of power supply failure, illumination shall be automatically provided from an
approved emergency system,

Section 2703.4 Material Safety Data Sheets. Amend by adding the following new Section
2703.4.1:

Section 2703.4.1 Location. The location of the required Material Safety Data Sheets
shall be as approved by the Fire Code Official.

Section 3308.1 General. Amend by adding the following new Section 3308.1.1;

Section 3308.1.1 Permit applications. Applications for permits shall be made in
writing at least thirty (30) days in advance of the display or discharge of fireworks.

Section 3308.1 General. Amend by adding the following new Section 3308.1.2:

Section 3308.1.2 Bond and Responsibility. Bond and responsibility for Fireworks
Display and Discharge requires "Public Liability Insurance in the amounts of not less
than one million dollars ($1,000,000.00) bodily injury and two hundred and fifty
thousand dollars ($250,000.00) property damage and the Darien-Woodridge Fire
Protection District shall be added as an additional insured.”

DEFINITIONS:
Wherever the term "Corporation Counsel” is used in the Codes adopted herein by reference, it
shall be held to mean the legal counsel for the Darien-Woodridge Fire Protection District

14




EXPLOSIVES AND BLASTING AGENTS: The storage, handling and use of explosives and
blasting agents is prohibited, unless authorized by the Fire Code Offficial.

APPLICATION OF PROVISIONS: Except as provided elsewhere in this Article, any existing
building and/or structure shall be brought into compliance with all applicable provisions of this Article
in the following situations:

A. If the structure or building is increased in floor area or in height, the entire structure or
building shall be made to conform with the requirements of this Article.

B. If any portion is changed in occupancy or use, that portion separated by approved fire-
rated construction shall be made to conform with the requirements of this Article.

C. If any portion is altered or remodeled in a dollar amount in excess of twenty-five (25%)
percent of the fair market value of the building or structure before the alteration or
remodeling in any five year period, the entire building structure shall be made to
conform to the requirements of this Article.

D. If a building or structure is damaged by fire or other cause in excess of fifty percent
(50%) of the fair market value before the damage occurred, the entire structure or
building (exclusive of foundation) shall meet the requirements of this Article.

FLAMMABLE LIQUIDS; LIQUIFIED PETROLEUM GASES:

A. The storage of flammable liquids in outside aboveground tanks is prohibited, unless
authorized by the Fire Code Official.

B. The bulk storage of liquefied petroleum gases in excess of one thousand (1,000) gallons
water capacity is prohibited, unless authorized by the Fire Code Official.

MANUFACTURING AND STORAGE OF FIREWORKS IS PROHIBITED:
The manufacture and storage of fireworks is prohibited within the limits of the Darien-
Woodridge Fire Protection District.

MODIFICATIONS: The Fire Code Official shall have power to modify any of the provisions of this
Article upon application in writing by the owner or lessee, or his duly authorized agent when there are
practical difficulties in the way of carrying out the strict letter of this Article, provided that the spirit of
this Article shall be observed, public safety secured, and substantial justice done. The particulars of
such modification when granted or allowed and the decision of the Fire Code Official shall be entered
upon the records of the District and a signed copy shall be furnished the applicant.

15




IL.
EMERGENCY PROCEDURES

When, in the opinion of the Director of the Fire Prevention Bureau, or the Fire Chief Administrator,
thete is an actual and immediate danger to life and property from the hazards of fire and explosion
arising from the storage, handling and use of hazardous substances, matetials and devices, and from
conditions hazardous to life or property in the use or occupancy of buildings or premises, the Ditectot
of the Fire Prevention Bureau or the Fire Chief Administrator may order the building to be vacated.
The Director of the Fire Prevention Buteau, ot the Fite Chief Administratot, may employ such labor
and machinery, equipment and devices, and cause the necessary work to be done to render the
occupants ot propetty temporarily safe, whether the procedute ptescribed in this section has been
nstituted or not.

Al Whete practical and time constraints permit, the owner and occupant or other person
responsible for the emergency condition shall be notified of the emergency condition, in -
writing, and shall have the option of making the condition safe where practical.

B. The ownet and occupants of the premises shall be jointly and severally liable for any
costs incutred in connection with the same.

C. The Board of Trustees shall cause proper action to be instituted against the owner of the
premises, and the occupants if different than the ownets, for the recovery of costs
incutred by the Darien-Woodridge Fire Protection District in the performance of the
emergency work.

16




